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Dear Editor,

We have read with great interest the article entitled 
“Significant Decrease in Liver Stiffness Detected by 
Two-Dimensional Shear-Wave Elastography After 
Treatment with Direct-Acting Antiviral Agents in 
Patients with Chronic Hepatitis C,”1 which was recently 
published in Turkish Journal of Gastroenterology. The 
authors concluded that successful hepatitis C virus 
eradication considerably decreased liver stiffness mea-
surement (LSM) in a relatively short period (12 weeks 
after treatment).

However, we would like to highlight some concerning 
issues raised from a critical reading of the article. In par-
ticular, our concerns regard patient stratification and how 
it may affect the actual results of the study.

First of all, what are the criteria that the authors applied 
to diagnose liver cirrhosis? The authors have stratified 
the patients into 2 subgroups: cirrhotic versus non-
cirrhotic. However, from a graphical analysis of the box-
plots in Figure 5, it appears that >50% of patients in 
the non-cirrhotic groups showed LSM compatible with 
liver cirrhosis2,3 before treatment and <25% showed 
12 weeks after the end of the treatment. The pre-treat-
ment diagnosis of cirrhosis should not rely only on LSM. 
As shown in a recent study, patients may show LSM 
compatible with liver cirrhosis before treatment, without 
being cirrhotic at all.4,5 Indeed, cirrhotic patients showed 
a median LSM reduction of 14%, whereas those who 

were improperly diagnosed as such showed a median 
LSM reduction that ranged from 37 to 57.5%.4 According 
to a recent meta-analysis, around 50% of patients with 
baseline LSM compatible with advanced liver fibrosis 
(F3 or F4 stages), 6-12 months after achieving SVR12, 
showed post-treatment LSM consistent with lower 
degrees of fibrosis.6

Our second concern regards the absence of patients’ 
stratification according to serum transaminases and 
how they may have impacted LSM decrease. Besides, 
the authors reported only the mean without standard 
deviation; therefore, the reader cannot understand the 
actual distribution of alanine aminotransferase (ALT) and 
aspartate aminotransferase (AST) among the patients. 
Once more, a correct stratification is of uttermost impor-
tance given that the decrease of LSM is higher in patients 
with baseline ALT ≥ 2 times the upper limit of normal-
ity (ULN).7 In particular, the probability of overestimation 
of 2 or more fibrosis grades is equal to 50% for AST and 
ALT values in the range of 2 ULN.4 Serum transaminases 
have been linked to the degree of necro-inflammatory 
activity of the liver parenchyma. This concept should be 
taken into consideration for a critical evaluation of LSM 
results because it has been proven that before viral eradi-
cation LSM is mostly influenced by tissue congestion 
and inflammation due to viral activity, rather than actual 
fibrosis.8,9 Therefore, it is safe to assume that it is mark-
edly affected by hepatic congestion and inflammation, 
and that serum transaminase levels can be used to esti-
mate the amount of ongoing damage indirectly. Besides, 
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to address this issue, inflammation-adjusted cut-offs 
have been proposed, despite their employment in the 
clinical practice is still in debate.10

We believe that if the authors address these issues, the 
overall quality of their research will improve, by discuss-
ing an ongoing debate on fibrosis stratification in patients 
with ongoing liver injury.
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Main Points

•	 Serum transaminases represent a confounding factor for 
liver elastography.

•	 Serum transaminases lead to fibrosis overestimation.
•	 Correct patients’ stratification by serum transaminases is 

crucial when interpreting elastography measurements.
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