
To the Editor

Ranitidine is one of the widely used H2 receptor
blockers for gastric disorders as it rarely has seve-
re hepatotoxicity (1, 2). To our knowledge, hepato-
toxicity due to ranitidine has not been reported in
a pregnant yet. We aimed to present a severe liver
function test elevation after single-dose ranitidine
in a nine-week pregnant woman.

A 36-year-old pregnant woman (nine gestational
weeks) was admitted with severe epigastric pain,
pyrosis and regurgitation after a lunch and was
hospitalized. Esophagogastroduodenoscopy was
performed and antral gastritis and mild hiatal
hernia were detected. Biochemical parameters we-
re in normal range. Ranitidine 150 mg bid and al-
ginic acid were given to the patient for severe epi-
gastric pain and pyrosis, and her pain was reli-
eved with this treatment. On the second day of ra-
nitidine treatment, ALT elevated to 1153 U/L,
AST: 742 U/L, ALP: 88 mg/dl, GGT: 196 mg/dl, to-
tal bilirubin: 3.66 mg/dl, conjugated bilirubin: 2.72
mg/dl, PT: 11.9 sec, and INR: 1.09. Hepatitis and
TORCH serologies were negative. Upper abdomi-
nal ultrasonography was normal except for two
hemangiomas in the liver and mild enlargement of
the spleen (13 cm). Ranitidine was discontinued.
It was observed that liver function tests decreased
gradually by day and at the end of the seventh day
had decreased to nearly normal values. Two weeks
later the liver function tests were completely in
normal ranges. Ranitidine has been used widely

and safely in pregnancy, especially in the first tri-
mester, due to its having no major teratogenetic
risk (3). There are limited papers about the use of
proton pump inhibitors (PPIs) in pregnancy (4),
but evidence about this issue remains insufficient.
Follow-up of liver function tests is usually not ne-
eded in ranitidine use since only rare and mild he-
patotoxicity of ranitidine has been reported (5).
We followed the liver function tests of our patient
since she was pregnant and were thus able to de-
tect the severe elevation in enzymes on the second
day. This condition could indicate the idiosyncra-
tic hepatotoxic effect of ranitidine. A well-descri-
bed idiosyncratic hepatic injury due to cimetidine
has been reported, but there has been no report of
such a reaction due to ranitidine. However, Lu-
yendyk et al. (6) has described an idiosyncrasy-li-
ke hepatic injury due to ranitidine in rats (6).
Black et al. (7) reported three cases of ranitidine
hepatotoxicity - two without icterus and one with
severe cholestatic condition; the liver function
tests of those cases were not severely elevated.
The other case, as reported by Lauritsen et al. (8),
had severe cholestatic table and severe liver func-
tion test elevation. As a result, following liver
function tests, especially in pregnants, may be
useful during ranitidine treatment, which has be-
en determined safe in general practice widely and
also in pregnancy.
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